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The people of the Most High have lived in Egypt long enough under the influence 
of a multiplicity of elohims (powers). It is time to return to the Father’s TRUTH. In 
1985, the Worldwide Web became the gateway to information. This gateway 
fulfilled the prophecy spoken in the book of Daniel by the Almighty. Daniel 12:4 
“But you, Dani'el, keep these words secret, and seal up the book until the time of 
the end. Many will rush here and there as knowledge increases.” Well, we have 
reached that time. The words spoken to Dani’el are working in the land. We are a 
part of this prophetic fulfillment. The question is what shall we do now that 
information is at our very fingertips? It has inspired me to no longer be ignorant of 
truth. Truth relating to the FATHER’S Word can now be revealed and found. 
“Truth Matters” and it is essential to eternal life. 

People of faith are trying to find their Hebrew Roots; some are trying to discover 
who they are; some are just trying to understand the truth in comparison to the 
thousands of years of error which has been taught. The problem being is that for 
over 1,800 to 1,900 years, the FATHER’S people have been entrenched in the 
one thing HE hates more than anything, and that is idolatry. The saddest part of 
all of this is that many of the FATHER’S people do not even know what aspect of 
idolatry they are engaged in and the majority doesn’t care. That is not my 
opinion. That is a fact based upon the many conversations that I have had with 
people of faith. Their word is, that what they are in, works for them. It doesn’t 
matter. My question is, do the Scriptures matter? That is the Old Testament. 

Davarim (Deuteronomy) 19:15 “15 "One witness alone will not be sufficient to 
convict a person of any offense or sin of any kind; the matter will be established 
only if there are two or three witnesses testifying against him.” The truth 
concerning the Father’s intent and purpose for HIS people can be established by 
this criterion. The witnesses are Scripture, that being everything from Genesis to 
the end of the Old Testament. It can be established by researching the majority 
of history. Science also validates the Father’s truth, and of course the Holy Spirit 
confirms all things. Now is the time for every man or woman to validate his or her 
salvation in light of what constitutes eternal life by the Scriptures. 

If you are one who believes that when you are dead you are done, then none of 
this matters. However, if there are questions of uncertainty in your mind, then 
now is the time to make your own personal calling and election sure and stop 
depending on an old paradigm established on a political agenda and not on 
Truth. 


